TOTOI QSTR
aamoﬁe 2Re3T

303 ToRtodh IR ATYWODH (ITHIR) Jgeods, 2017
(20178 DgRSRod decdhs Bos-32)

R0 owé)eodo TSP &)mﬁooja VIR, 19863, I SNTIB  [eBe
WOTD WTCONT.

BY J, WHOT FOWMNT  LOTFEINVMRN  PUZ TPYHEOD  PIRW  DTRLODH
VOAODT, 1986, (19868 FIoFwd ©LRICHI  22) DIW), IWIB SRR
O3NTNTHTBOOT;

QW POUB N0 E OBZoRe THETY FTDorwT 0ok DPOSOBOO0T B
BROOTOZ VHICHWITONSF:~

L Zo3® IxS P FWPo- (1) 3 OOICLITIR, P03 Tofeod BIRD
DTWOOD (SR HR) LHIOD, 2017 DOW FTODITZY.

(2) 9t 38 ZRAESe OR WIBTTY,

2. 43¢ IFOMRT SWHIB.- PTUT TOLKOD IR WMYVOD  wHICHI, 19867

(19868 BJ0Fe3 @A  22) 43¢ TICPTY  (2)Je  YLTTITCRT  ITV@OD By
mondQ{ ﬁe@ﬁéz@cﬁ%, N0TT:—

“(3) B HHIONT DB BT VBONY [RRT DACLPNTY DFe L.IRROBT TR,
WOONY IR WPTTZO3 BRRDODYTID HEEDNIT), FIoFWT QWA ATRENRN
S0eRFOORIIT),

DTCR: B3 TFTEOT LB BTN FIOFEIT IR QTRRHF’ 0TI~

(1) o3Fee TOEoD HOOST BH ITFAYR FRDODYT WBHODITR  DTRHF
BP0 HBIS B0W WTTO TN FIOF 3T oazszsdeg mf%m@peﬁe&; DB
(i) DepProl VBFED TOEOD 20D VWD JREAYR ID VYT VTP

BJ0F T COBBOTII mséé TRT  OSRRPTOTTR WO 5@2@3’5 xo:q;ﬁ#eg
@mézpaéﬁ BRBTLIE®. '



e:\)cgcsn@a aos_oo FTING OB

TIOFWT w0 é)w%@i—‘ﬁ@fﬁﬁ Jesqd mwgegos TRV ;’\)663371%333%
NeRAOF ZPTE THOD IR ATRLOD VHIODI, 19867, SHIB  [RBWIYID
@aﬂeﬁéﬁdom DONBRCONT.

SBO0T, 83 DGeoDS.



(o OFmeN $ONCEOXRNS)

FTOFEIT VIR X3
Samqﬁe NTOT B
5@@@@&@ ©PIeTT
703 Toge0D TRATH DERLD (SWTA) Feods, 20173 (20178 DgRSRE

OFeods Hos; 32) TR

3¢ wABOE ToODTH, LI F SFro WO |B|OOT

8¢ B.0.RODBOT, TSR, FOROEOH FITOONH =B Y TR0
S0ENEH, FRWC BTN T3 oaééeoda TOTOR DRLOD (STHBB) DFeoDs, 20173
(20178 QoSSR QGeodT :doaﬁéz 32) 8 B[OOOT STHIAODI), Idw I
VB EITH, B3 WRVT B, NeDTE, BOWODREES, OTT:-

Q0% 2
RCO DPeoPFT 23¢ DOBTY, RedZL euredxoer 43¢ TFOEYI (3)e
NTZFTTE,~
(1) “Berd R[IYOB” 20w TITNOR “Besr BIB0Z” w0w  TWEEY
BBOIREIRIYTY; )
(i1) DVCHODYT  (ii)Fe 23000[Y  “0tH JHEAPR” S0 TINER “DH

TIREAPR” 20w TINTDY, T3O3LeBIBT,

QXF. Toweer
FoCDFTSF (FgoT)






BRNE ToRTZT FEOF) OSFTE BT PR, WIRROBIRDY,

-

8.0, moHWeT,
IR, FOTOCH BTTOONH B
REY VETOBWO TOINRW.

T, REF
FoODFTEE (J)
BIOFLT DT RS



(ORetAleln)

TS ca%co:: PRERT DTTVCD RICHTN, 1986T (1986T 3Tz LPRACDHTH 22)

emd%s N
XX XX XX
4, amsooxacs mc(sbcsrieéo taaasa.—
XX XX XX

(2) oDy JoNPBIYD, wION, TJOF, WE WP BRENTIR),
TONBRT Y FIFT, QTP JINONH WOTTNTBELR, DB TP, WTFTNTTY,
wﬁgﬁ IR BRFTTON WP DTRHF 3N TR VB wBwo Y oIwYIe
TTII, TBROTED OB Y TTI0DI, TEODL WTD ©WIT  0IRTHIe
DBTWOTITI), VPPV oNFT JOWFOH  WFPD  WTEBRY  DOTTC
TOLFODIW, VHWRT FOSRWTTNTBIZ Y.

XX XX XX

THFO DNTFROOD, VTR PG P, Bonded, &7, BIN , ~J3N0 1000, 193¢ IeT 2017



Bayiad No:

FOURTEENTH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
FOURTEENTH SESSION

THE NATIONAL LAW SCHOOL OF INDIA (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2017
(L.A. Bill No. 32 of 2017)

A Bill further to amend the National Law School of India Act, 1986.

Whereas, it is expedient to amend the National Law School of India
Act, 1986 (Karnataka Act 22 of 1986) for the purposes hereinafter
appearing;

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the sixty eighth

year of the Republic of India as follows.-

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the
National Law School of India (Amendment) Act, 2017.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of section 4.- In section 4 of the National Law
School of India Act, 1986 (Karnataka Act 22 of 1986) after sub-section (2),
the following shall be inserted, namely:-

"(3) Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act and the
regulations made thereunder, the school shall reserve not less than thirty

percent of seats for resident students of Karnataka.

Explanation: For the purpose of section 'resident student of

Karnataka" means,-

(1) a student who or either of whose parents has resided in the
State of Karnataka for a period of not less than ten years

preceding the qualifying examination; and

(iij a student who has studied in any one of the recognized
educational institutions in the State for a period of not less than

five years preceding to the qualifying examination."



STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

It is considered necessary to amend the National Law School of India
Act, 1986, to reserve not less than thirty percent of seats for resident

students of Karnataka.

Hence the Bill.



(Provisionally admitted)

KARNATAKA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
FOURTEENTH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY

FOURTEENTH SESSION

Amendments to the National Law School of India (Amendment) Bill,
2017 (L.A. Bill No. 32 of 2017).

By Shri Basavaraj Rayareddy, Minister for Higher Education)

I on behalf of Shri T.B. Jayachandra, Minister for Law, Parliamentary
Affairs and Minor Irrigation, hereby give notice of my intention to move the
following amendments to the National Law School of India (Amendment) Bill,
2017 (L.A. Bill No. 32 of 2017), namely:-

Clause 2

In the said Bill, in clause 2, in section 4, in sub-section (3) sought to be
inserted.-
(i) for the words "thirty percent" the words "fifty percent" shall be
substituted; and
(iiy in explanation, in item (ii) for the words "five years" the words

"seven years" shall be substituted.

(S.MURTHY)
Secretary (I/C)






FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

There is no extra expenditure involved in the proposed Legislative

measure.

T.B.JAYACHANDRA
Minister for Law, Parliamentary Affairs
and Minor Irrigation

S. Murthy
Secretary (I/c)
Karnataka Legislative Assembly



ANNEXURE

Extract from the National Law School of India Act, 1986
(Karnataka Act No. 22 of 1986)

XX XX XX

4. The Objects of the School etc.-
XX XX XX

(2) The School shall be open to all persons of either sex irrespective of
race, creed, caste or class of all religions and it shall not be lawful for the
school to impose on any person any test whatsoever of religious belief or
profession in order to entitle him to be admitted thereto as a teacher or a
student or to hold any office therein or to graduate thereat or to enjoy or to
exercise any privilege thereof.

XX XX XX

Government Press, Vikasa Soudha Unit, Bengaluru 19* June, 2017 P7, W.D., Copies 1000



